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The casual users survival guide! For users who understand the basics and want a brief text to demonstrate the
less intuitive functions. The book is aimed at Project Management Professionals who are casual or new users
and understand the software basics but require a short and snappy guide. It is the sort of book that may be
read without a computer on the bus, train or plane. This book quickly gets down to the issues that many
people grapple with when trying to use some of the more advanced features of the software and enlightens
readers on the traps that some users fall into and how to avoid them. It demonstrates how the software ticks
and explains some tricks that may be used to become more productive with the software and generate better
schedules. Suitable for people who understand the basics of Microsoft Project but want a short guide to give
them insight into the less intuitive features of the software. It is packed with screen shots, constructive tips
and is written in plain English. The book is based on the Microsoft Project 2013 and 2016 but may be used
with earlier versions of Microsoft Project as this book points out the differences where appropriate.
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From reader reviews:

Gertrude Call:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book which
improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want truly feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual 99 Tricks and Traps for
Microsoft Project 2013 and 2016 is kind of publication which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Eleanor Williams:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its include may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that
fantastic as in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually 99 Tricks and Traps for Microsoft Project
2013 and 2016 why because the amazing cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint you actually. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading
6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Doreen Williams:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for you is 99 Tricks and Traps for Microsoft Project 2013 and 2016 this book consist a lot of
the information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world
has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer
made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Tina McKinney:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books in the
top listing in your reading list is usually 99 Tricks and Traps for Microsoft Project 2013 and 2016. This book
which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking
way up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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