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"Fast-paced courtroom drama that makes the pages turn with its depiction of the American Legal Justice
System, Mob rule, and the tale of one rookie lawyer who refused to quit!" - American Institute of Justice

Thaddeus Murfee is twenty-five, single, a lawyer of eighteen months, and completely unprepared for the
murder case that walks in. While Ermeline was passed out, her date carved his name in her breasts. Heavy,
thick letters: V-I-C-T-O-R. 

The guilty party is found murdered. Or was he guilty? Ermeline is arrested because she had motive and
opportunity. She hires Thaddeus, who makes his debut defending his first murder case in this courtroom
drama.

Ilene is a beautiful widow who loves horses. Ilene is introduced to Thaddeus one Saturday morning as he is
caring for his own horse. She invites him to Christmas dinner. Soon Thaddeus finds himself in great need of
her care and she rushes in to help. Will her love be enough to pull him through this courtroom thriller?

Paralegal Christine Susmann, home from the war in Iraq, uses her military training to help Thaddeus put
together the defense. Together they discover the dark forces behind the case and Christine teaches him how
to arm himself and how to shoot--a skill he will need. The suspense mounts while alibis fall away and the
killer's plot is discovered.

In The Defendants, John Ellsworth offers you a courtroom thriller that puts you right on the front row to
witness how murder cases are defended. See the politics behind all criminal cases, and how love can grow
out of the strangest beginnings anyone could imagine. In the end, Thaddeus is given a split second to save his
own life. His reaction is amazing!

Interview with the Author

Q - So, what makes the Thaddeus Murfee series special?

A - It's a mix of things, really. When I set out to write these books, I wanted to create something that
mirrored exactly the kind of books I like to read. My top picks are usually legal thriller novels, any of the
thousands of courtroom fiction and crime fiction best sellers, and, of course, books featuring your classic
lawyer heroes get my vote.

The Thaddeus Murfee books are a great mix of these genres. You'll find the series focuses on legal thrillers
and crime thrillers / courtroom drama overall, with one or two medical thrillers thrown in!

Overall, the Thaddeus Murfee series is designed to keep you turning the pages - and I've made sure there's
never a dull moment.

Q - What order should I read the books in?

A - I've written the series so you can read the books in any order, and all the story threads will tie up nicely



by the time you're finished. If you do want to read them in order, I'd suggest the following sequence:

- The Defendants

- Beyond a Reasonable Death

- Attorney at Large

- Chase, the Bad Baby

- Defending Turquoise 
- The Mental Case (coming soon) 

Q - So, why should readers give these books a try?

A - Because the Thaddeus Murfee series is a fast, fun, thrill-ride that keeps you up late! Each of the books
has hit the bestsellers list, and each have been featured on Amazon's Thrillers top 100 list. 

Ultimately, readers who enjoy fast pacing with a plot that twists and turns all the way to the end will get a
kick out of this series.

Q - Can readers get the whole series in one go?

A - First three. I've put together a bundle of 1-3 if people want to save a little money and grab the first three
books in one swoop. Check out my author page here at Amazon for more details, and a full list of my
available titles.

And thanks for reading! 
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Rector:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name The Defendants
suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled The
Defendantsis a single of several books which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many men
and women in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you
ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
understand the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now.
To help you to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Verna Smith:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this The
Defendants, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book. Your knowledge can
inspire average, make them reading a guide.

Joan Henderson:

The Defendants can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away
because this e-book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand,
bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to get every
word into joy arrangement in writing The Defendants yet doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Donald Murray:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that question
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know
that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually The Defendants.
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