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An eye-opening, myth-shattering examination of what makes us fat, from acclaimed science writer Gary
Taubes.

In his New York Times best seller, Good Calories, Bad Calories, Taubes argued that our diet’s overemphasis
on certain kinds of carbohydrates—not fats and not simply excess calories—has led directly to the obesity
epidemic we face today. The result of thorough research, keen insight, and unassailable common sense,
Good Calories, Bad Calories immediately stirred controversy and acclaim among academics, journalists, and
writers alike. Michael Pollan heralded it as “a vitally important book, destined to change the way we think
about food.”

Building upon this critical work in Good Calories, Bad Calories and presenting fresh evidence for his claim,
Taubes now revisits the urgent question of what’s making us fat—and how we can change—in this exciting
new book. Persuasive, straightforward, and practical, Why We Get Fat makes Taubes’s crucial argument
newly accessible to a wider audience.

Taubes reveals the bad nutritional science of the last century, none more damaging or misguided than the
“calories-in, calories-out” model of why we get fat, and the good science that has been ignored, especially
regarding insulin’s regulation of our fat tissue. He also answers the most persistent questions: Why are some
people thin and others fat? What roles do exercise and genetics play in our weight? What foods should we
eat, and what foods should we avoid?

Packed with essential information and concluding with an easy-to-follow diet, Why We Get Fat is an
invaluable key in our understanding of an international epidemic and a guide to what each of us can do about
it.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Gagne:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Why We Get Fat: And What to
Do About It book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the information in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Grady Comer:

Why We Get Fat: And What to Do About It can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that could increase your
knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information.
The copy writer giving his/her effort to set every word into joy arrangement in writing Why We Get Fat:
And What to Do About It however doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well as
based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into
completely new stage of crucial contemplating.

Melvin Schroeder:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find publication that need more time to
be examine. Why We Get Fat: And What to Do About It can be your answer given it can be read by an
individual who have those short spare time problems.

John Hayes:

You can get this Why We Get Fat: And What to Do About It by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing
or reviewing it can to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide
are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern
era like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you
to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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