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Note from the Author: Christians are not immune to the world’s pressures, and sometimes we go to church
without the Good News penetrating into our “real lives.” We get swayed by messages—overt and
covert—about who we are and who we should be. We think that God does not speak to these concerns other
than to say, “Do this” or “Don’t do that.” It is only when we look beneath the nice words spoken so
eloquently from the pulpit that we realize God gave us the guidelines because they are so very practical.
They keep us, if we let them, from stumbling into heartbreaking situations. The two stories in The Friendship
Series aim to take the reader on a journey with Christians who in the beginning don’t seem to let their
Christianity inform their encounters with the world to Christians who realize that God showed us His Way
because it works—not just in theory but in real, actual, everyday life.

***
Aaron Foster thought he had the perfect life until his fiancee walked out of their apartment and then back in
again with his new roommate. In desperation Aaron and his best friend, Harmony Jordan, devise The Plan to
save Drew's heart from getting shattered, but when The Plan succeeds beyond their wildest expectation, it
could spell heartache for them all.

Harmony Jordan has loved Aaron Foster since the first minute he rescued her from a literal computer crash.
The only problem is, Aaron only sees her as a friend. Trying to be content to be the person Aaron goes to
when life crashes around him, Harmony puts her heart on the line for him to help him rescue his in-for-real-
trouble new roommate. However, she never expected the roommate to fall for her, or for her to fall for him.
Now what?

“Eternity,” a gem among Contemporary Romance novels, proves romances can be melded with inspirational
books to produce something truly amazing and unexpected. Delving into and through the subject most
contemporary romance books are predicated upon—free and easy sex, “Eternity” shows that romance novels
don’t have to have characters hopping into bed to be romantic, fun, and entertaining. Further, it seeks to
dispel the myth that all romantic relationships must start and end in the bedroom. As romance books go, it
has all the romance in a clean, inspirational read that any lover of romance novels will appreciate.

*~ Excerpt ~*

Aaron was trapped. When he turned and leaned on the door, his gaze fell to the phone. In a flash he had it in
his hand, and in less than a second the other end was ringing.

“Hello?” Harmony's voice drifted over the lines.

“It’s her,” he said in utter desperation.

“Aaron?”

“They’re downstairs.”



“Right now?”

“On my couch. They are making out on my couch!”

“Oh, no.”

“Could you give me something a little more than oh, no?”

“Crud.”

“Yeah, that’s closer. Oh, man. What am I going to do?”

“Are you sure it’s her?”

“Harmony.”

“Okay. Of course you’re sure. Okay. Okay. Let me think. Where are you?”

“In my room.”

“Do they know you’re home?”

“No. I don’t know. I don’t think so.”

Her side went silent for a moment. “The fire escape’s on your window isn’t it?”

He looked at the window in trepidation. “Yeah, but it’s only for emergencies.”

“Hello!”

The plan was looking better and better all the time. “But where am I supposed to go? It’s 12:30 in the
morning!”

Without more than a second’s pause, her voice softened. “You could come over here.”

That stopped him. In all the time he had known her, he had never been to her place, not even once. “Your
place? Are you sure?”

“You’re in trouble,” she said as if stating the case for a jury. “When a friend’s in trouble, you do whatever
you have to to help them out.”

“Even this?”

She didn’t say anything for a long moment. “I think I’ll live.” Quickly she gave him the directions.

He smiled, momentarily forgetting the disaster downstairs as he wrote them down. “I’ll be there in ten
minutes.”
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Leonard:

Here thing why this specific Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book 1) are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good but it depends in the content from
it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The
Friendship Series, Book 1) giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any book out
there but there is no guide that similar with Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship
Series, Book 1). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing which
happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like
in playground, café, or even in your way home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the
published book maybe the form of Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book
1) in e-book can be your option.

David Wysocki:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a book.
It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the entire day to reading a
publication. The book Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book 1) it is quite
good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You
can m0ore quickly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book
offers high quality.

Bruce Alexander:

Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book 1) can be one of your beginning
books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that
will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The article author giving his/her effort to place every word into pleasure arrangement in writing
Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book 1) but doesn't forget the main stage,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource details that maybe you can be considered one
of it. This great information could drawn you into brand new stage of crucial considering.

Johnny Relyea:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of
book Eternity: An Inspirational Romance Novel (The Friendship Series, Book 1). You can include your



knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make anyone
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one spot to
other place.
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