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He Seemed So Normal . . .

By day, Robert Lee Yates, Jr., was a respected father of five, a skilled helicopter pilot who served in Desert
Storm and the National Guard, and a man no one suspected of a deadly hidden life. By night he prowled the
streets where prostitutes gathered, gaining their trust before betraying them with a bullet to the head.

On August 26, 1997, the decomposed bodies of two young women were discovered in Spokane, Washington.
Within months four more women were added to the mounting death toll.

In 2000, Yates pleaded guilty to thirteen murders to avoid the death penalty. But in 2001 he was convicted of
two more murders and is now on death row in Washington State, waiting for the day when he will die by
lethal injection.

Updated with the latest disturbing developments, awardwinning author Burl Barer's reallife thriller is a
shocking portrait of one man's depravity.

"Brilliant investigative journalism. . .a nonstop chilling thrill ride into the mind of an evil and savage killer."
Dan Zupansky, author of Trophy Kill

Includes 16 pages of photos

"A must read." True Crime Book Reviews
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From reader reviews:

Sam Holmes:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book Body Count will make you to
become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you
think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be thought
like that? Have you seeking best book or suited book with you?

Barbara Barnes:

Here thing why this particular Body Count are different and reputable to be yours. First of all studying a
book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or
not. Body Count giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any guide out there but
there is no publication that similar with Body Count. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up
your current eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you.
You can bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your means home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Body Count in e-book can be your alternate.

Deborah Mazzarella:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The Body Count is kind of
reserve which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

David Hoag:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Body Count can make you experience more interested to read.
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