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This edited book examines the management of diversity and inclusion in the military.

Owing to the rise of asymmetric warfare, a shift in demographics and labor shortfalls, the US Department of
Defense (DoD) has prioritized diversity and inclusion in its workforce management philosophy. In pursuing
this objective, it must ensure the attractiveness of a military career by providing an inclusive environment for
all personnel (active and reserve military, civilian, and contractors) to reach their potential and maximize
their contributions to the organization. Research and practice alike provide substantial evidence of the
benefits associated with diversity and inclusion in the workplace. Diversity and inclusion programs are more
strategic in focus than equal opportunity programs and strive to capitalize on the strengths of the workforce,
while minimizing the weaknesses that inhibit optimal organizational performance. This new book provides
vital clarification on these distinct concepts, in addition to offering concrete best practices for the successful
management of diversity and inclusion in the workplace. Written by scholars and practitioners, each chapter
addresses major areas, raises crucial issues, and comments on future trends concerning diversity and
inclusion in the workplace.

The book will be of great interest to students of military studies, war and conflict studies, business
management/HRM, psychology and politics in general, as well as to military professionals and leaders.
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From reader reviews:

Shad Broussard:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like studying a
book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Managing Diversity in the Military: The value of inclusion in a culture
of uniformity (Cass Military Studies).

Lurline Silvester:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Managing Diversity in the
Military: The value of inclusion in a culture of uniformity (Cass Military Studies) will make you to always
be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that
open or reading any book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they may be thought like that?
Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Joseph Boyd:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Managing Diversity in the
Military: The value of inclusion in a culture of uniformity (Cass Military Studies) book as starter and daily
reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Clarence Cavins:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write
about the data about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of
them is this Managing Diversity in the Military: The value of inclusion in a culture of uniformity (Cass



Military Studies).
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