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For most of us, remembering the Holocaust requires effort; we listen to stories, watch films, read histories.
But the people who came to be called “survivors” could not avoid their memories. Sol Nazerman,
protagonist of Edward Lewis Wallant’s The Pawnbroker, is one such sufferer.

At 45, Nazerman, who survived Bergen-Belsen although his wife and children did not, runs a Harlem
pawnshop. But the operation is only a front for a gangster who pays Nazerman a comfortable salary for his
services. Nazerman’s dreams are haunted by visions of his past tortures. (Dramatizations of these scenes in
Sidney Lumet’s 1964 film version are famous for being the first time the extermination camps were depicted
in a Hollywood movie.)

Remarkable for its attempts to dramatize the aftereffects of the Holocaust, The Pawnbroker is likewise
valuable as an exploration of the fraught relationships between Jews and other American minority groups.
That this novel, a National Book Award finalist, remains so powerful today makes it all the more tragic that
its talented author died, at age 36, the year after its publication. The book sold more than 500,000 copies
soon after it was published.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin House:

The reserve with title The Pawnbroker: A Novel includes a lot of information that you can find out it. You
can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book exist new understanding the information that exist in
this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the the positive effect. You can read
the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Eric Frances:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping The Pawnbroker: A Novel that give
your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading routine all over the world
can be said as the method for people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It
can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to
become success person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, it is possible to pick
The Pawnbroker: A Novel become your own starter.

Steven Resnick:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find e-book
that need more time to be read. The Pawnbroker: A Novel can be your answer given it can be read by you
who have those short spare time problems.

Virginia Carter:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to your account is The Pawnbroker: A Novel this book consist a lot of the information in the
condition of this world now. That book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes this
book. That is why this book ideal all of you.
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