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The bestselling guide now updated with video demonstrations and audio tracks online

The guitar is one of the most versatile instruments in the world, which is why it's so appealing to musicians.
Guitar For Dummies, 4th Edition gives you everything a beginning or intermediate acoustic or electric
guitarist needs: from buying a guitar to tuning it, playing it, and caring for it. Fully revised and updated, with
online video and audio clips that help you learn and play along, you'll explore everything from simple chords
and melodies to more challenging exercises that are designed to satisfy players of all levels. Additionally,
new players can dive into the basics of guitar and accessory selection. Whether you prefer the cool sounds of
the acoustic or the edgier tones of the electric, your guitar will get a lot of use as you play your way through
the lessons presented in this integral book. But your journey doesn't stop at the last page! With an updated
multimedia component, you have access to more than 80 online videos and 35 audio tracks that help build
your talent.

Play along with online videos and audio tracks to develop and reinforce your new skills●

Tune your guitar, change strings, and make simple repairs to keep your instrument in working order●

Choose the right guitar and equipment for your needs●

Explore numerous musical styles, including rock, blues, jazz, and country●

Guitar For Dummies, 4th Edition guides you in the development of your strumming talent—and who knows
where that can take you!
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From reader reviews:

Terrie Delgadillo:

The book Guitar For Dummies can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book Guitar For Dummies?
Wide variety you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It
is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or information that you take
for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Guitar For Dummies has simple
shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous world by
open up and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Emilie Lechner:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This Guitar For Dummies book is readable by means of you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving
actually decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer regarding Guitar For Dummies content
conveys the idea easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content but it just different available as it. So , do you still thinking Guitar For Dummies is not loveable to be
your top list reading book?

Dennis Ross:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This reserve Guitar For Dummies was filled with regards to science. Spend your free
time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has various feel when they
reading any book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication.
In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Harry Thomas:

Many people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Guitar For Dummies to make your current
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you just like reading.
Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the idea about book and
examining especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that
the publication Guitar For Dummies can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse
using what must you're doing of the time.
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