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This book, first published in 2007, is an introductory textbook on quantum field theory in gravitational
backgrounds intended for undergraduate and beginning graduate students in the fields of theoretical
astrophysics, cosmology, particle physics, and string theory. The book covers the basic (but essential)
material of quantization of fields in an expanding universe and quantum fluctuations in inflationary
spacetime. It also contains a detailed explanation of the Casimir, Unruh, and Hawking effects, and introduces
the method of effective action used for calculating the back-reaction of quantum systems on a classical
external gravitational field. The broad scope of the material covered will provide the reader with a thorough
perspective of the subject. Every major result is derived from first principles and thoroughly explained. The
book is self-contained and assumes only a basic knowledge of general relativity. Exercises with detailed
solutions are provided throughout the book.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Arnold:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular
spare time to take a wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book
allowed Introduction to Quantum Effects in Gravity? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You already
know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than
before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

Elbert Gibson:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is
high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Introduction to Quantum Effects in
Gravity book as basic and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Edward Lott:

The knowledge that you get from Introduction to Quantum Effects in Gravity may be the more deep you
digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean
that this book is hard to comprehend but Introduction to Quantum Effects in Gravity giving you joy feeling
of reading. The author conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by means of anyone who
read it because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. That book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this Introduction to Quantum Effects in Gravity instantly.

Everett Dean:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Introduction to Quantum Effects in Gravity will give you a new experience in looking
at a book.
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