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Although the nation changed substantially between the presidential terms of Thomas Jefferson and Abraham
Lincoln, these two leaders shared common interests and held remarkably similar opinions on many important
issues. In Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation, Ronald L. Hatzenbuehler describes the
views of two of our nation’s greatest presidents and explains how these views provide valuable insight into
modern debates.

 In this groundbreaking new study—the first extended examination of the ideas of Lincoln and
Jefferson—Hatzenbuehler provides readers with a succinct guide to their opinions, comparing and
contrasting their reasoned judgments on America’s republican form of government. Each chapter is devoted
to one key area of common interest: race and slavery, the pros and cons of political parties, state rights versus
federal authority, religion and the presidency, presidential powers under the Constitution, or the proper
political economy for a republic. Relying on the pair’s own words in their letters, writings, and speeches,
Hatzenbuehler explores similarities and differences between the two men on contentious issues. Both, for
instance, wrote that they were antislavery, but Jefferson never acted on this belief, while Lincoln moved
toward a constitutional amendment banning slavery. The book’s title, taken from the Gettysburg Address,
builds on both presidents’ expectations that Americans should dedicate themselves to the unfinished work of
returning the nation to its founding principles.

Jefferson and Lincoln wrestled with many of the same issues and ideas that intrigue and divide Americans
today. In his thought-provoking work, Hatzenbuehler details how the two presidents addressed these issues
and ideas, which are essential to understanding not only America’s history but also the continuing influence
of the past on the present.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Gould:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book Jefferson, Lincoln, and the
Unfinished Work of the Nation will make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if
you can know about everything. But some of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It's not
make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suitable book with
you?

Otis Kozlowski:

This Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation book is simply not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside
this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This particular Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation without
we understand teach the one who studying it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't always be
worry Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation can bring any time you are and not make
your tote space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile
phone. This Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation having very good arrangement in
word and also layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Kathleen Duff:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of several ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon
about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Rubin Bourne:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but also novel and Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the
Nation or maybe others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book,
you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or even students especially.



Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science e-book, any other
book likes Jefferson, Lincoln, and the Unfinished Work of the Nation to make your spare time considerably
more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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