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Oedipus the King * Aias * Philoctetes * Oedipus at Colonus

Sophocles stands as one of the greatest dramatists of all time, and one of the most influential on artists and
thinkers over the centuries. In these four tragedies he portrays the extremes of human suffering and emotion,
turning the heroic myths into supreme works of poetry and dramatic action. Oedipus the King follows
Oedipus, the 'man of sorrow', who has unwittingly chosen to enact his prophesied course by murdering his
father and marrying his mother. In Aias, the great warrior confronts the harrowing humiliation inflicted upon
him, while Philoctetes sees a once-noble hero nursing his resentment after ten years of marooned isolation.
In Oedipus at Colonus the blind Oedipus, who has wandered far and wide as a beggar, finally meets his
mysterious death.

These original and distinctive verse translations convey the vitality of Sophocles' poetry and the vigour of the
plays in performance. Each play is accompanied by an introduction and substantial notes on topographical
and mythical references and interpretation.

ABOUT THE SERIES: For over 100 years Oxford World's Classics has made available the widest range of
literature from around the globe. Each affordable volume reflects Oxford's commitment to scholarship,
providing the most accurate text plus a wealth of other valuable features, including expert introductions by
leading authorities, helpful notes to clarify the text, up-to-date bibliographies for further study, and much
more.
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From reader reviews:

Arthur Sanchez:

The book Oedipus the King and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King, Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus
(Oxford World's Classics) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave the good thing like a book Oedipus the King and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King,
Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus (Oxford World's Classics)? Several of you have a different opinion
about e-book. But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each other;
you are able to share all of these. Book Oedipus the King and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King, Aias,
Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus (Oxford World's Classics) has simple shape but you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Robert Thompson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you lot
of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you read,
if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read one together
with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Oedipus the King and Other Tragedies:
Oedipus the King, Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus (Oxford World's Classics) is kind of guide which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Jeffery Harman:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the headline Oedipus the King
and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King, Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus (Oxford World's Classics)
suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled Oedipus
the King and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King, Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at Colonus (Oxford World's
Classics)is the one of several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people
in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new age that you ever know just before. The author
explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-
book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world with this book.

Harvey Lee:

You can obtain this Oedipus the King and Other Tragedies: Oedipus the King, Aias, Philoctetes, Oedipus at
Colonus (Oxford World's Classics) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by



simply written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era like now,
you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own
personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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