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Though he may not speak of them, the memories still dwell inside Jacob Jankowski's ninety-something-year-
old mind. Memories of himself as a young man, tossed by fate onto a rickety train that was home to the
Benzini Brothers Most Spectacular Show on Earth. Memories of a world filled with freaks and clowns, with
wonder and pain and anger and passion; a world with its own narrow, irrational rules, its own way of life,
and its own way of death. The world of the circus: to Jacob it was both salvation and a living hell.

Jacob was there because his luck had run out?orphaned and penniless, he had no direction until he landed on
this locomotive "ship of fools." It was the early part of the Great Depression, and everyone in this third-rate
circus was lucky to have any job at all. Marlena, the star of the equestrian act, was there because she fell in
love with the wrong man, a handsome circus boss with a wide mean streak. And Rosie the elephant was there
because she was the great gray hope, the new act that was going to be the salvation of the circus; the only
problem was, Rosie didn't have an act?in fact, she couldn't even follow instructions. The bond that grew
among this unlikely trio was one of love and trust, and ultimately, it was their only hope for survival.

Surprising, poignant, and funny, Water for Elephants is that rare novel with a story so engrossing, one is
reluctant to put it down; with characters so engaging, they continue to live long after the last page has been
turned; with a world built of wonder, a world so real, one starts to breathe its air.
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From reader reviews:

Terrence Kimball:

This Water for Elephants: A Novel book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information inside this reserve
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
specific Water for Elephants: A Novel without we realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Water for Elephants: A Novel can bring if you are and
not make your tote space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop
even cell phone. This Water for Elephants: A Novel having good arrangement in word as well as layout, so
you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Teresa Riggs:

Here thing why that Water for Elephants: A Novel are different and trusted to be yours. First of all looking at
a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or not.
Water for Elephants: A Novel giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any
guide out there but there is no guide that similar with Water for Elephants: A Novel. It gives you thrill
examining journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is
perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your
method home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of
Water for Elephants: A Novel in e-book can be your alternative.

Lyla Jackson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Water for Elephants: A Novel which
is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

David Fern:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of Water for Elephants: A Novel can give you a lot of good
friends because by you considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make you actually more
like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer
you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Water for Elephants: A Novel.
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