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A history of gladiators—with an added bite!

It’s hard for modern readers to truly grasp the spectacle that was arena sports in ancient Rome, which pitted
man against man and man against beast in mortal combat. Our modern games of football and hockey, or
even boxing and MMA, truly pale in comparison. The Gladiators is a comprehensive survey of these ancient
sports, focusing on gladiatorial combat and the beast hunts (venationes). While many books have been
written on arena spectacles in ancient Rome, they generally neglect the venationes, despite the fact that the
beast hunts, of various dangerous wild animals (including lions, tigers, elephants, and rhinos), were almost as
popular as gladiatorial spectacles and endured over a longer period of time. Dr. Christopher Epplett gives a
full and detailed treatment of both types of spectacle.

The author starts by explaining the origins of these bloody combat sports in the late Roman Republic before
surveying the growth of these events during the first two centuries of the Empire, when emperors possessed
the resources to stage arena spectacles on an unmatched scale. The details of the training, equipment, and
fighting styles used by different types of combatants are covered, as are the infrastructure of the arenas and
behind-the-scenes organization that was essential to the successful staging of arena events. Particular
attention is paid to the procurement of the countless wild animals necessary to stage venationes throughout
the Empire. A gladiator book with added bite, The Gladiators is sure to be welcomed by scholars and general
readers alike.

Skyhorse Publishing, as well as our Arcade imprint, are proud to publish a broad range of books for readers
interested in history--books about World War II, the Third Reich, Hitler and his henchmen, the JFK
assassination, conspiracies, the American Civil War, the American Revolution, gladiators, Vikings, ancient
Rome, medieval times, the old West, and much more. While not every title we publish becomes a New York
Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are committed to books on subjects that are sometimes
overlooked and to authors whose work might not otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Garcia:

The e-book with title Gladiators: Deadly Arena Sports of Ancient Rome has lot of information that you can
learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new information the information that
exist in this guide represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how
the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the internationalization. You can read
the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Carl White:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book
like comic, brief story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not striving Gladiators: Deadly
Arena Sports of Ancient Rome that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world a great
deal better then how they react to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice only for the
geeky individual but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start
reading through as your good habit, you could pick Gladiators: Deadly Arena Sports of Ancient Rome
become your own personal starter.

Earline Shepler:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you read a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, because book
has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you have
read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Gladiators: Deadly Arena Sports of Ancient Rome provide you with a new experience in reading through a
book.

Henry Carlino:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended
for you is Gladiators: Deadly Arena Sports of Ancient Rome this reserve consist a lot of the information in
the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. This is why this book acceptable all of you.
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