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American presidents enter office ready to enact a policy-making agenda that will satisfy partisan interests
and facilitate reelection to a second term. Economic circumstances, however, may catch presidents in a
vicious cycle of economic growth and inflation versus recession and unemployment. Faced with a public that
assigns to the chief executive responsibility for the nation's economic health, presidents are often forced by
the dynamics of this cycle to make tradeoffs between pursuit of political objectives and stabilization of the
economy. Vicious Cycle: Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy examines the
strategic calculus that drives presidential acceptance of these decision-making tradeoffs. It provides a
theoretical framework for explaining how presidents pursue partisan and electoral objectives in office, while
simultaneously managing the nation's economy within the constraints of a complex institutional
environment. With an approach that bridges several literatures in presidential studies and political economy,
Constantine J. Spiliotes develops an econometric model of postwar presidential decision making in the
American political economy and employs its insights to explicate the empirical dynamics of economic
decision making in four presidencies. The extensively documented studies—Presidents Eisenhower,
Johnson, Carter, and Reagan—offer variation across several analytic dimensions: temporal, partisan,
electoral, and institutional. Spiliotes concludes that presidential acceptance of decision-making tradeoffs
between the pursuit of political objectives and the imperatives of institutional responsibility is driven by a
transformation in the nature of the American presidency, from an office in which decision making is
anchored in partisan accountability to one in which decision making is constrained by the chief executive's
institutional mission. Spiliotes's work will contribute to a fuller understanding of the presidency, political
economy, and the methodologies that elucidate them.
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From reader reviews:

Diane Williams:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled VICIOUS CYCLE: Presidential Decision Making in the American
Political Economy (Presidency and Leadership Studies, 9). Try to make book VICIOUS CYCLE:
Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy (Presidency and Leadership Studies, 9) as
your friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience and knowledge with
this book.

Marjorie Brown:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get lot of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of course.
People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are there when the spare
time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you have read
is VICIOUS CYCLE: Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy (Presidency and
Leadership Studies, 9).

Alma Driver:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled
VICIOUS CYCLE: Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy (Presidency and
Leadership Studies, 9) your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect
that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a
reserve then become one application form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get
previous to. The VICIOUS CYCLE: Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy
(Presidency and Leadership Studies, 9) giving you another experience more than blown away the mind but
also giving you useful facts for your better life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at
this point is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a
game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Thomas Morgan:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose often the book VICIOUS CYCLE: Presidential Decision
Making in the American Political Economy (Presidency and Leadership Studies, 9) to make your reading is



interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose
simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about book and studying especially. It is
to be first opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the book VICIOUS CYCLE:
Presidential Decision Making in the American Political Economy (Presidency and Leadership Studies, 9) can
to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what must you're doing of that time.
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